
TWENTY-FIRST SUNDAY IN ORDINARY TIME 

     

 

 
 

 

 

 

† - For the repose of the soul / in memory of the person(s) indicated 
 
 

Sunday, August 27 

Twenty-first Sunday in Ordinary Time 

9:00 a.m.  For Fr. Vincent’s Intentions. 

10:30 a.m.  For Bob Henry’s health and well-being  by 

  Jeanette and Geraldine. 

  † Beryl Winnifred Darmanie Lamsee on what  

  would have been her 100th birthday by her son. 
 

Tuesday, August 29 

The Passion of St. John the Baptist 

9:00 a.m.  For Concetta Marinelli’s health by the Marinelli  

  family. 
 

Wednesday, August 30 

9:00 a.m. † Souls in Purgatory. 
 

Thursday, August 31 

9:00 a.m.  For the living and deceased members of the  

  Chevalier family. 
 

Friday, September 1 

First Friday 

9:00 a.m. -------- 
 

Saturday, September 2 

4:30 p.m.  † Venanzier Marinelli by the Marinelli family. 
 

Sunday, September 3 

Twenty-second Sunday in Ordinary Time 

9: 00 a.m.  For the parishioners of St. Theresa Parish. 

10:30 a.m.  -------- 

. 
 

 

 

PLEASE REMEMBER THE SICK IN YOUR PRAYERS:  
 

Joan Marie (Ryan) Potvin, Michelle Boyer, Baby Ivy Murray, 

Nickie Shaw, Marie-Andrée Boyer, Patricia McNamara, 

Raechael McIntyre, Moli Coletti, Zygmunt Wysocki, Linda 

MacNay, Theresa Tam-Sue.    

 
 
 

Prayer for Vocations: Twenty-first Sunday in Ordinary 
Time – August 23 
 
 

That trusting in Christ’s words to Peter, all those called to 
follow the Lord as priests, deacons and in the 
consecrated life will recognize the gift of their call and 
follow Him faithfully, we pray to the Lord. 
 

 

 

HOLY FATHER’S PRAYER INTENTION 

 

For people living on the margins ~ We pray for those 

people living on the margins of society, in inhumane 

life conditions; may they not be overlooked by 

institutions and never considered of lesser importance. 
 

 

 

 

 

TWENTY-FIRST SUNDAY IN ORDINARY TIME 

(Year A) 
 

First Reading:   Isaiah 22.15, 19-23 

  I will place his shoulder on the key of the 

  house of David. 
 

Second Reading:  Romans 11-33.36 

  All things are from Christ and through him  
  and for him.  

 

Gospel:  Matthew 16.13-20 

  You are Peter.  I will give you the keys of the  

  kingdom of heaven 
. 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

Saturday, September 2 

4:30 p.m. Marie Comisso 
 

Sunday, September 3 

9:00 a.m.  Paulette Michel 

10:30 a.m.  Kathy McVean 
 

 
 

 

 
 

St. Theresa Parish welcomes Natalie Osborn and 
Amedeo Cardinelli baptized this Sunday into our 
Christian community. 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 

 



AUGUST 27, 2023 
     

 

 

CENTRETOWN FOOD CENTRE 
 

The monthly food collection for the Centretown Food 
Centre is taking place at the back of the church after all 
the Masses this weekend.  Your generosity is greatly 

appreciated.  
 

 
 

 

COME SING THE GLORY OF GOD! 
 

St. Theresa choir needs singers for the 10:30 a.m. 
Sunday Mass. Singing in the choir is a wonderful way to 
participate in the liturgy. The choir will start singing on 
Sunday September 10, 2023.  The weekly Wednesday 
evening rehearsal from 07:00 to 08:30 p.m. will resume 
on September 6. 
 

If you are interested in joining, please contact the 
organist Danielle Binette either by email, text or phone 
at:  danbinette@videotron.ca  (819) 777-8441.   

 

 
 

 

ANNOINTING OF THE SICK 
 

We will be re-instating our semi-annual Anointing of the 
Sick during the Mass on Friday, September 8 at 10:30 
a.m.  A light lunch will follow in the hall. 

 

 
 

 

CHILDREN’S LITURGY 
 

The Children’s liturgy will resume Sunday, September 
10, 2023. Any parent wishing to enroll their child in First 
Communion or Confirmation classes, please contact Wendy 
Schieman 613-230-4552. 

 

 
 

 

PARISH BBQ + AGM 
 

Father Vincent invites everyone to our annual parish 
BBQ on Sunday, September 10, 2023 after the 10:30 
a.m. Mass.  The Annual General Meeting (AGM) will 
follow the BBQ. 

 

 
 

 

RCIA 
 

If you are an adult, and would like information on 

Baptism, Confirmation or First Communion, or being 

received into full communion with the Catholic 

Church, please speak to the Pastor after a weekend 

Mass.  St. Theresa Parish will be offering RCIA (Rite 

of Christian Initiation) classes this fall after the 

Sunday, 10:30 a.m. Mass. 
 

 
 

 

ST. PHOEBE DAY COMMEMORATION 
 

St. Phoebe was a woman of great courage and deep 

love. She answered God’s call to minister to God’s 

people during the earliest days of the Church, when 

persecution against Christians was strong. She 

earned Paul’s trust, who depended on her to handle 

communications with the ecclesial community in 

Rome. St. Phoebe’s feast day, September 3rd, is in 

the current Roman Martyrology. Her day’s liturgical 

status is not a feast or memorial but that of a 

“commemoration” which our parish community will 

be celebrating as St. Phoebe Day.  
 

All are welcome to celebrate St. Phoebe on her day of 
commemoration next Sunday, September 3, after the 
10:30 am Sunday Mass in the parish hall. Light 
refreshments will be served. Join us in continuing the 
conversation of women’s roles and participation in 
today’s Church.  

 

 
 

 

CHRISTMAS BAZAAR DROP-OFF 
 

The next bazaar drop off is Saturday, September 12 
from 3:00 – 4:30 p.m.  The only items we are not 
accepting are clothing and toys. For donations/questions 

please call Kathleen at 720-841-1386. 
 

 
 

 

13th ANNUAL AUTUMN PILGRIMAGE 
 

ST. JOSEPH ORATORY 
 

SUNDAY, OCTOBER 15, 2023 
 

Info: MIKE - 613-224-8110 mike.budge@bell.net 
 

mailto:danbinette@videotron.ca

